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Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Henke of 
Eastover Road entertained at 
their home for 17 members of 
their family following the bap­
tism of their son, Jason Howard 
at the First Reformed Church in 
West Sayville, Sunday. Jason is 
the Henke's first child. 

Wednesday, October 25 at 10 
a.m. the Sayville Home Ex­
tension Day Unit will be meeting 
at the Sayville Fire House. 
Lessons will be given in both 
Meat and Crewel. 

Mrs. Randall Whitaker of 
Colton Avenue and Mrs. George 
Schreiber of Foster Avenue, 
members of the Sayville Village 
Improvement Society, attended 
the Presidents Council Luncheon 
of the Long Island Federation of 
Womens Clubs held last Friday at 
Carl Hoppel's in Baldwin. 

Wednesday, October 11, at the 
meeting of the Ladies Service 
Group of the Sayville Methodist 
Church a party was held to 
celebrate the birthday of two of 
the members, the 90th birthday of 
Mrs. Leah Spare and the 95th 
birthday of Mrs. Carrie Hoost. 
Mrs. Spare had to miss the 
festivities because of illness. 
Both ladies received a gift and all 
enjoyed a lovely birthday'cake. 

Both Mr. and Mrs. Anthony 
Sconzo of Mill Pond Road 
celebrated their birthdays last 
week. Mrs. Sconzo on October 9 
and Mr. Sconzo on October 11. On 
Wednesday October 11, 20 family 
members gathered at the-Sconzo 
home to celebrate both events. 

Mr. and Mrs. George 
Morrissey of Eric Court attended 
a marriage encounter weekend 
held from Friday to Sunday at 
Howard Johnson's in Brentwood. 

Several members of the 
Sayville Congregational United 
Church of Christ attended the 42 
Churchman's Fellowship Retreat 
at the Lisle Conference Center in 

Lisle, N.Y. from Friday through 
Sunday. The theme of the con­
ference was "Changing Life 
Styles. Attending from the area 
were: Mr. and Mrs. Alfred 
Kennedy, Mr. and Mrs. Harold 
Eaton, Mr. and Mrs. George 
Morrell, Mr. and Mrs. Irving 
Winters Sr., Mr. and Mrs. Albert 
Both and Mr. and Mrs. Mark 
Redlein. 

Barbara Simmons, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Richard Simmons 
of Lowell Road was 12 years old 
Monday, October 16. On Satur­
day, Barbara entertained for ten 
of her classmates from St. 
Lawrence School in honor of the 
occasion. Monday evening a 
family party was held with 
Barbara's grandmother, Mrs. 
Grace Ticho of New York City 
•present. 
Win Dinner for 2 at Haji Baba fun 
competition Wed. nights for 
Amateur Belly dancers 567 • 5577 

Laura Gallagher, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Joseph Gallagher of 
Candee Avenue celebrated her 
12th birthday Wednesday Oc­
tober ll. A family party was held 
at the Gallagher^ home with 
Laura's grandfather Mr. John 
Flood of Sayville present.. 

Three Sayville students who 
attend Sayville High School have 
been notified that they have been 
selected to sing in the All State 
Sectional Chorus which will be 
held on Long Island on November 
17. The girls are Miss Carolyn 
Baumann, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Edward Baumann of Lowell 
Road who will sing in the alto 
section; Miss Rachel Zimmer, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Donald 
Zimmer of Amy Drive who will 
sing in the soprano section and 
Miss Laurie Lonardo, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Anthony Lonardo of 
Wyandanch Road who will sing in 
the soprano section. 

Maureen Shelbqurne, daughter 

THE CLAMDIGGER 
FISH MARKET 

30 Brown's River Road, Sayville 
(Next to Port O'Call) 

SAT. & SUN. ONLY - 10/14 - 10/15 
• LUNCH & DINNER SPECIAL 

STUFFED SHRIMP 1 75 
(Includes Slaw, FF & Tartar Hot To Go!) • • - * * • * 

Open Ail Year - Fri. Till - 8 
Open 6 Days • Closed Mon. • Fresh Fish Dally' 

LUNCH and DINNERS TO GO LT 9-6144 

WHAT'S SO CRERT RBOUT 

NLEIN" 
• ,U..HEINLElN HARDWARE CO., INQ. 

EVERYTHING IN HRRQWRRE 
PLUMBING SUPPLIES 

HJQDSEWARES i PAINT • CLOCKS 
WINDOW SHADES i GARDEN TOOLS 

• EARLY AMERICAN GIFTWARE 

100 MAIN ST. 589-2010 SAYVILLE 
Enter rear parking lot from Qandee Ave. 
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of Mr. and Mrs. William 
Shelbouren of Candee Avenue, 
was 12 years old, Friday, October 
13. In the evening Maureen eq-
tertained at a dinner party for 16 .; 
of her girl friends in honor of the 
occasion. ..-•*. 

Four Sayville High School j 
students who live in Sayville have : 

been chosen to perform in the 
Long Island String Festival 
which will be held later in the 
year. Chosen were Craig Martin, 
son of Mr.-and.Mrs. William J; 
Martin of Sayville Boulevard, • 
who will perform on the base; 
Darryl Binder, son of: Mr. and 
Mrs. Emile Binder of Montauk ':• 
Highway who also will perform 
on the base; Miss Susan Lonardo, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. An- •, 
thony" Lonardo of Wyandanch : 
Road, who will perform on the 
violin and Miss Barbara"Holmes, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Paul 
Holmes of Versa Place who will 
also-perform on the violin. 

Hall of Frame, Inc., Discount 
Art and Picture Frame Center, 
Main Street, Sayville. 

The Sayville Garden Club will 
meet Monday, October 23. at the 
Fire House. -The meeting will 
begin at 2 p.m., following which a 
workshop on Pine .Cones, under 
the chairmanship of Mrs. 
Thomas Mc Golderick Jr. of 
Bayport, will be held. 

Saturday, October 14 the 
Suffolk County Committee 
American Legion Auxiliary 
honored the county's,Gold Star 
Mothers at a luncheon held at 
Bronco Charlies in Oakdale. 
Smith - Weaver Post Gold Star, 
mothers present were Mrs. Anna 
Reylek and Mrs. Mary Kwaak. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Clowe 
and Chrisy of Painted Pos.t, N.Y. 

, spent the weekend at the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Garl Warren of 
Foster Avenue. While here they 
visited friends in the area. Mr. 
Clowe, who is now retired, was 
formerly assistant superin­
tendent of schools in charge of 
business for the Sayville Public 
Schools. 

Mrs. Mae Darrow of. Dunn 
Court, returned home Tuesday 
after spending five days at the 
home of her. niece and her 
husband, Mr. and Mrs. Edward 
Rutkowski of Bradford, Vermont. 

Mr. and Mrs. William Reilly of 
Handsome Avenue celebrated 
their 15th Wedding Anniversary, 
Thursday, October 12. Friends 
stopped by the Reilly home to 
help them celebrate the occasion. 

Seventeen members of the ,. 
Sayville Garden Club attended \ 
the Second Distridt < Fall" Lun-" 
cheon and Meeting held at the 
Colonie Hill in Hauppauge, 
Monday. The Sayville Garden 
Club was awarded a District 
Citation for the Year Book 1972 -
73. This is the secondi year the 
club has been cited for this 
award. Four members served as 
hostesses: Mrs. Joseph Paulonis, 
Mrs. David Barbour, Mrs. Clyde 
Culp and Mrs. Knute Nelson. 

Mr. and Mrs. Alfred Brunini of 
Saxton ' Avenue returned last 
Friday after a ten - day trip 
through New England to see the 
fall foliage. They visited at the 
homes of their sons in Stoneham, 
Mass. and Burlington, Vt. 
Annual Christmas Bazaar, 
Metlakhatia Chapter, 439 O.E.S. • 
Sayville Main Street (next door to 
fire department) October 21, 9 to 
6 Refreshments served. 

Rev. Joseph Kelly, C.S.sp., who 
has been on speaking 
engagements in up - State New 
York, Wisconsin and Indiana 
while on leave from his Mission in 
Tanzania, left this' week for 
further engagements in 

(Continued on Page 6) 

NOW THAT YOU'VE GOT 
THE LEAVES, we've got the 
Rakes, Leaf Bags, and Holders. 
HEINLEIN'S, 100 Main St, 
Sayville. 589-2010. 

Bayport Blue Point News 
Bea Engels 363-6141 

WEARING A HAPPY SMILE, the Committee of the Oakdale Auxiliary to 8outh«Ide Hospital reviews 
the Luncheon - Card Party held on October 3 st Timber Point Country Club In Great River. They are, 1 
tor; Mrs. William A. Sessions, Mrs. Henry Milner, co-chairman; Mrs. Lewis Fabel, chairman; and 
Mrs. Murray Gluck. 
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West Sayville 
Mrs. Erich Coners 
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James Dietz Jr., Mr. and Mrs. 
Bruce Style and Miss Sherry 
Dietz honored their parents, Mr. 
and" Mrs. James Dietz* of 
Rollstone Avenue with a 25th 
wedding anniversary dinner held 
at the Sunset Inn in.Sayville. 
Fifty family members and 
friends, many from out of town, 
helped the Dietz's celebrate this 
happy occasion. Those out of 
town guests who stayed for the 
weekend at the Dietz home were, 
Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Lux of 
Midland Park, N.J.; Miss 
Patricia Smith of Dallas, Tex. 
Mr. Pat Chamberlain of Dallas; 
Tex.; and Paul Bradley of 
Houston, Tex. 

Mr. and Mrs. Abram Wessels of 
Diyision Avenue has as then-
weekend guests, their brother - in 
-law and sister, Mr. and Mrs. 
Aubrey Gould of BaldwinsvUle, 
Mass* 

In response to the President's' 
call for a National Day of Prayer, 
the Christian.Reformed Church 
help? an evening prayer service,' 
Wednesday. The offering' that 
evening was donated to foreign 
mission work in the Phillipines. 

Debra Tirelli, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Frank Tirelli of Brook 
Street, a student at SUNY at 
Potsdame spent from Thursday 
to Sunday visiting with her 
family at home. 

Miss Chris Goetz, daughter of 
Rev. and Mrs. Alfred Isaksen of 
Atlantic Avenue, has been 
honored by being the only 
Sayville High School student to be 
chosen to sing in the Conference 
All State Chorus. Miss Goetz will 
sing alto. Chosen to sing in the All 
State Sectional Chorus to be held 
on Long Island on November 17 
were: Miss Goetz, Miss Pat 
Trinkwald, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Vincent Trinkwald of 
Hillside Avenue, who will sing 
soprano; Miss DenisePostupack, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs.. Daniel. 
Postupack of Hillside Avenue, 
who will also sing soprano; Miss 
Nancy Besemer, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. William Besemer of 
Rollstone Avenue, who will sing 
tenor; and Miss Dorothea Popp, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Alfred 
Popp of Weaver Road, who will 
also sing tenor. 
Win Dinner for 2 at Haji Baba fun 
competition Wed. nights for. 
Amateur Belly dancers 567 • 5577 

Carl William Van Essendelft, 
infant son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Richard Van Essendelft of 

Rollstone Avenue, was baptized 
by Rev. Edward Cooke, during 
the morning worship service at 
the Christian Reformed Church, 
Sunday. 
* Mr. and Mrs. Charles'Levesque 
of Rollstone Avenue returned 
home Friday, following a two 
weeks vacation. They spent one 
week visiting at the home of Mr. 
and Mrs! William Perry in 
Scottsdale, Ariz, and then spent 
the remainder of the time 
traveling across the country, 
camping along the. way. 

Jay Reinsma, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. John Reinsma of Rollstone 
Avenue, has been chosen to 
represent Sayville High School in 
the Conference All State Band. 
Jay will perform on the french 
horn. Janet Cunningham, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Nathaniel Cunningham, will' 
represent the high school by 
playing in the Conference All 
State Orchestra. Janet will 
perform on the viola. These 
students, with Miss Chris Goetz, 
who will sing with the Conference 
All State Chorus, will be in 

•Rochester, from December 1 to 
December 5 and will be per­
forming in the concert to be held 
at the Eastman School of Music. 

Rev. Marion Bradwell, 
Executive Director of the Lord's 
Day Alliance was the guest 
minister, Sunday evening, at the 
Christian Reformed Church. 

Miss Margaret Kuiken of 
Rollstone Avenue is spending the 
week visiting at the home of 
brother - in - law and sister and 

LT 9-1440, 

family, Mr. and Mrs. Nelson Van 
Essendelft of Terra Ceia, N.C. 
Ine Van Essendelft's are former 
West Sayville residents. 

At the l l a.m. service held in 
the First Reformed Church, 
Sunday, Rev. Marvin Meeter 
officiated at the baptism of Jason 
Howard, infant son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Kenneth Henke of Sayville. 

Mr. and Mrs. William Van 
Essendelft of Rollstone Avenue, 
returned home last Tuesday 
following a three weeks' 
vacation. They traveled through 
the mid'- west visiting their 
children and friends. They 
stopped at Calvin College In 
Grand Rapids, Mich, to visit their 
son Roy, then visited Mr. and 
Mrs. William Van Essendelft in 
St. Paul, Minn., Mr. and Mrs. 
Harold Van Essendelft in 
Markham, 111, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Ghahramani in North 
Chicago, HI. They also visited 
friends in northwest Iowa and 
South Dakota. 

Bride-to-be latest styles as 
shown in bridal magazines; also 
bridesmaids and flower girl 
costumes; by appointment only. 
Call Lillian LT 9-06050 ADV-TF 

Miss Jean Van Essendelft and 
her sister, Mrs. John Marken-
stein of Rollstone Avenue, 
returned home last Monday after 
a vacation. They visited first at 
the home of their brother - in - law 
and sister, Mr. and Mrs. Lou 
Meyer in Savanah, Ga. and then 
spent ten days visiting friends in 
Florida. 

(Continued on Page 6) 
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Oakdale 
By Lu Lawrence LT $-4871 
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An investiture ceremony was 

held October 3 at the Oakdale -
Bohemia Jr. High School by Girl 
Scout Troop 89 led by Mrs. Anne 
Grantner. The following girls 
took part in the ceremony: Jane 
Barrett, Alicia Bradshaw, Lisa 
Brown, Cathy Caulfield, Susan 
Doutney, Jennifer Esposito, 
Diane Farrell, Mary BethHoppe, 
Ann Marie Kornely, Karen 
Lewis, Laura Sherene, Maria 
Ranierr', Karen Sigilio, Liz 
Worthy and Lori Wright. During 
the meeting, pictures were shown 
from the recent camping trip 
held at Camp Matta Wacca in 
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September. 
A special meeting of the Bosti 

Parent Council was held last 
Thursday evening at the Edward 
J. Bosti School. The council, led 
by Chairman, Esther Tarasco, 
discussed plans for the for­
thcoming Halloween Carnival to 
be held later this month for Bosti 
students. The regular meeting of 
the Bosti Parent Council will be 
held this evening, October 19. 

A dance was held last Friday 
evening at the Oakdale - Bohemia 
Jr. High School. The music for 
the evening was supplied by 
Edmund Byrd and his group. 
Win Dinner for 2 at Haji Baba fun 
competition Wed. nights for 
Amateur Belly dancers 567 - 5577. 

All of Oakdale's first - year 
Juniors took part in a camping 
trip last weekend at Camp Edey. 
The rain, winds and cold weather 
last weekend tested the en­
durance and spirit of these young 
scouts on their first camping trip. 
The girls did remarkably well on 
this camping training session, 
overcoming the problems of poor 
weather. The 64 girls were ac­
companied by the following 
leaders and co - leaders: Anne 
Grantner, Pat Kornely, Dit 
Hoctnier, Claire Cartier, Denise 
Caracopa, Sue Walsh, Debbie 
Cartier, Cathy Lippe, Pam 
Samulik and Lorraine Doutney. 

Hall of Frame. Inc. Discount 
Art and Picture Frame Ccnler 
Main Street. Sayville. 

Among the October 28 sale 
items unearthed from one of the 
barns in East Hampton by W.K. 
Vnnderbilt Historical Society 
members were a domed Vic­
torian glass case, wiffle trees, 
corn planter, pully, buggy seat, 
Early American pine hutch table, 
two old sleds, a collection of 
wicker baskets, quilting frame, 
crocks of all kinds, a melodian 
desk with Acanthus leaf legs, 
circa 1850, barrels, a Bennington 
cuspidore, a pine wash stand, an 
old bayonet and much more. 

Anyone wishing to place items 
in this column please call 363-6141 
U it is possible please call Friday 
mornings. However items will be 
cheerfully accepted at any time. 

The Blue Point Lions Club met 
October 4 at Sunland on the Bay, 
In Blue Point. Deputy Inspector 
Stanley Andryslk, commander of 
the Fifth Precinct, Suffolk 
County Police Department and 
former FBI man, gave an In­
teresting talk on the workings of 
the Police Department. The club 
is now collecting items for their 
annual yard sale, the proceeds of 
which go toward helping the 
community. Anyone having any 
items of any sort, household 
items, clothing, etc. may contact 
any Lion Club member or Bob 
Brown's grocery store, Blue 
Point Avenue, Blue Point to 
arrange for pickup. Lion Club 
members may be identified by a 
Lion Flower box on their lawns. 
New members are welcome to 
join. Meetings are the first and 
third Wednesday of each month 
at Sunland on the bay, Atlantic 
Avenue Blue Point at 7:00 p.m. 

Win Dinner for 2 at Haji Baba 
fun competition Wed. nights for 
Amateur Belly dancers 567-5577. 

The Annual Bazaar for the 
United Church women of the 
Bayport Methodist Church will be 
held oh Thursday, October 26, 
from 10:00 a.m. until 8:00 p.m. at 
the Methodist Church, Middle 
Road, Bayport. A luncheon will 
be served, which includes home­
made clam chowder. The tables 
will be set up to include a variety 
of items, such as,,plants, baked 
goods, hand-made items, white 
elephant, a country store, 
Christmas ' counter, toys, and 
special notions for children to 
purchase. Anyone interested in 
donating plants or baked goods 
for the affair, should contact the 
Chairman, Mrs. Ronald 
Ringhouse at 472-0994. 

Mr. & Mrs. Gary Pole and their 
children Antoinette, two years 
old, and Gary, Jr., who is five 
months old, have recently moved 
Into their new home on Bayport 
Avenue, Bayport. They are 
formerly of Utica. 

Hall of Frame, Inc. Discount 
Art and Picture Frame Center 
Main Street, Sayville. 

Mrs. Rita Weyer of Kensington 
Avenue, Bayport, .Mrs. Alice 
Lucas of Amy Drive, Sayville, 
and Mrs. Bea Engels of 
Reinhardt Court, Blue Point, 
attended a tea at The White 
House in East Hampton last 
Saturday afternoon. It was given 
by thaniel Gardiner Chapter of 
the National Society of the 
Daughters of the American 
Revolution in honor of Mr. and, 
Mrs. Robert David Lion Gar­
diner. The White House so named 
because it was used as a summer 
home by Mr. Gardiner's gran-
daunt, Julia, and her husband, 
President Tyler was toured by 
the group. Among the many 
treasures and antiques in the 
house is a recent portrait of Mrs. 
Gardiner painted in 1967 by the 
world famous artist, Salvadore 
Dali. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Behr and 
their son, Harold, of Middle 
Road, Bayport have just returned 
from a week's vacation at Mrs. 

Behr's sister and brother-in-law, 
Mr. and Mrs. John Gloeggler of 
Pittsburgh, Pa. While there, they 
enjoyed attending a Pittsburgh 
Pirates baseball game at the 
Three Rivers Stadium. One of the 
highlights of the visit was. a 
dinner party which Mrs. 
Gloeggler gave for several 
friends and acquaintances. On 
their return trip, Mr. and Mrs. 
Behr took a tour of the Penn­
sylvania-Dutch country, around 
Manheim and Lancaster, Pa'. • 

Mr. & Mrs. Joseph Bentlyegna 
formerly of Fort Hamilton, 
Brooklyn, and their children, 
Jay, who is seven, and six-year 
old twin boy and girl, Chuck and 
Missis, have moved into their 
new home on North Division 
Avenue, Blue Point, .;-

The Bayport-Blue Point 
Booster's held . their monthly 
business meeting October 11 at 
Sunland on the Bay. All present 
felt the turnout of parents In­
dicated a strong support for the 
club and it's goals. A committee 
was. formed to organize tl)e 
Booster Club sponsorship of the 
Winter Wrestling Tournament to 
be held at the James Wilson 
Yoiing High School. The date and 
time of the tournament will be 
announced at a later date.-The 
Club urges parents to become 
members and take an active part 
in the athletic program for the 
students. The next meeting will 
be November 8 at Sunland oh the 
Bay, Atlantic Avenue, Blue 
Point at 8 p.m. • , 

. • l 

CSEA Endorses 
Candidates 
Th<? political Action Committee 

of the Town of Islip Civil Service 
Employees Assbciation . has 
endorsed the entire Islip Town 
Republican team of candidates 
for state and federal office. 

Republ ican cand ida te s 
receiving Town of Islip CSEA 
endorsement included James R. 
Grover, Jr., Second 
Congressional District; Islip 
Councilman Caesar Trunzo, 
Third State Senatorial District; 
John C. Cochrane, Sixth 
Assembly District; Dennis 
O'Doherty, Fifth Assembly _ 
District; and Anthony Coraci, *" 
Third Assembly District. 

A spokesman for the Islip Town 
CSEA said the endorsements 
were given to the five candidates 
"because it was felt they could do 
the best job representing CSEA 
interests." 
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It is now possible to have 
copies of photos from r 

REFLECTIONS OF THE PAST, 
past and current.<, 

5 x 7 or smaller. .S42 .00 -
8 x 10 .$3.00 
.for personal use only 

Send remittance and description 
of photo!i) to • ' 

R.H. DOUGHERTY ' u 

SAYVILLE HISTORICALSOCIET 
Box 658 Sayville, N.Y. 11782" 
Include your name and address 
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CONNELLY'S HARDWARE 
OPEN SUNDAYS 9 to 4 

69 MAIN ST. LT 9-1076 WEST SAYVILLE 
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